
 
SESSIONAL CLINICAL LECTURER 

 
 

The Leslie Dan Faculty of Pharmacy, University of Toronto, invites applications for the 
position of Sessional Clinical Lecturer to co-coordinate a mandatory course, PHM206H1 
Medication Therapy Management 3 (MTM 3), which is scheduled in the winter term of the 
second year of the Doctor of Pharmacy (PharmD) program. The position is offered from 
October 15, 2020 until May 31, 2021. 

 
This second year course is the third course in a four-part course series that is delivered 
longitudinally over three years of the PharmD program.  It builds on the skills developed in 
previous MTM courses (MTM1 & MTM2), offering students opportunities to apply and 
integrate materials learned through all courses in the curriculum to date.  This course 
focuses on the development of skills required for both hospital and community pharmacy 
practice.  Lectures and applied simulated practice sessions emphasize the pharmacist’s 
role and responsibilities as a communicator, care provider, collaborator and advocate to 
prepare students for APPE rotations.  The course will be taught using a variety of 
techniques including lectures, case-based learning, virtual interactive cases and 
standardized patient simulations. Due the uncertainty with COVID 19 there is a high 
likelihood that this course will be delivered virtually via the online platform zoom, or as a 
hybrid of online and in-person activities. 

 
The expected enrollment for this course is 240 students. Clinical Instructor support is 
provided for case-based interactions and assessments. 

 
Applicants should be a l i censed pharmacist.  Candidates must have experience in a 
clinical practice setting within the Canadian Health Care system. The successful candidate 
must demonstrate excellence in teaching, currently practice in, and demonstrate a strong 
knowledge of the relevant field, and, possess excellent organization and communication 
skills. Experience in the development and delivery of courses is an asset, including online 
course delivery.  Strong clinical and technological skills are assets. 

 
For specific questions about this position, please contact: Dr. Jamie Kel lar , Acting 
Director, PharmD Program, Leslie Dan Faculty of Pharmacy (Jamie.kellar@utoronto.ca) 

 
Please submit your application to AcademicHR.phm@utoronto.ca . Applicants should 
include a cover letter, current curriculum vitae, a statement of teaching philosophy, and the 
names and contact information of three referees. The deadline for applications is 
September 30, 2020; the position will remain open until filled. 

 
All qualified candidates are encouraged to apply; however, Canadians and permanent 
residents will be given priority. 
 
Diversity Statement 
The University of Toronto is strongly committed to diversity within its community and 
especially welcomes applications from racialized persons / persons of colour, women, 
Indigenous / Aboriginal People of North America, persons with disabilities, LGBTQ persons, 
and others who may contribute to the further diversification of ideas. 
 

mailto:AcademicHR.phm@utoronto.ca


 
 
Accessibility Statement 
The University strives to be an equitable and inclusive community, and proactively seeks to 
increase diversity among its community members. Our values regarding equity and diversity 
are linked with our unwavering commitment to excellence in the pursuit of our academic 
mission. 
 
The University is committed to the principles of the Accessibility for Ontarians with 
Disabilities Act (AODA). As such, we strive to make our recruitment, assessment and 
selection processes as accessible as possible and provide accommodations as required for 
applicants with disabilities. 
 
If you require any accommodations at any point during the application and hiring process, 
please contact tara.snyder@utoronto.ca. 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 


